# **Stalisfield Parish Council Freedom of Information Act Procedure**

# Introduction & Scope

The Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOI) gives rights of public access to information held by public authorities.

- public authorities are obliged to publish certain information about their activities; and
- members of the public are entitled to request information from public authorities

The Act covers all recorded information held by a public authority. It is not limited to official documents and it covers, for example, drafts, emails, notes, recordings of telephone conversations and CCTV recordings. Nor is it limited to information created by Stalisfield Parish Council (SPC), so it also covers, for example, letters received from members of the public, although there may be a good reason not to release these (see Appendix 2).

A FOI request is not the same as responding to enquiries/questions raised in association with the ordinary business of SPC.

### **Responsibilities**

All **Councillors** and **Clerks** are responsible for identifying FOI Requests. Requests may not always be clearly marked "FOI" by the public.

All Councillors and Clerks should forward FOI Requests to the Parish Clerk.

The **Parish Clerk** will record the FOI Request and acknowledge receipt, providing a schedule for the 20 day rule and issue a Fees Notice where necessary (see below).

The **Parish Clerk** will co-ordinate information gathering where that information is not available on the internet.

The **Parish Clerk**, after liaising with the **Chairman**, will notify the requester and any other Public Body if the request is passed to another Authority.

The **Chairman** of the Council will release all FOI Responses prior to the **Parish Clerk** sending a response where that information is not readily available on the internet.

# Principles of the FOI Act

- 1. Section 10 of the Act sets out the time frames within which a public authority must respond to an FOIA request. It applies whenever the public authority has:
  - a duty under section 1(1)(a) to confirm or deny whether the information is held;

- a duty under section 1(1)(b) to provide information that is held to the requester;
- a duty under section 17 to issue a refusal notice explaining why a request has been refused.
- a) SPC must respond to requests promptly and by the twentieth working day, starting the working day after the Request has been received.
- A working day is any day other than a Saturday, Sunday, or a day which is a bank holiday.
- b) If the authority needs further details to identify or locate the information, then the 20 working days will commence the day after it receives the required clarification from the requester.
- c) Where required, SPC may claim a reasonable extension of time to consider the public interest test. However, this must not extend beyond an additional 20 working days.
- 2. Where the authority requires a fee to process the request, the 'clock' will stop on the date the Parish Clerk issues a **Fees Notice** to the requester and restart once payment is received.
  - Under section 10(2) the period starting from the day the Fees Notice is given and ending on the day the payment is received can be disregarded from any calculation of the 20 working day time limit.
  - The Information Commissioner's interpretation of the wording 'the day on which the fees notice is given' is the date on which the notice is sent to the requester.
  - SPC should therefore pause the 20 working day clock on the day it issues the Fees Notice. The clock will restart again the day after the fee is received.
  - If the requester elects to pay by cheque then the clock will only restart once this has cleared.
  - Should the requester fail to provide the fee within 3 months of the fees notice being issued, then under section 9(2) of the Act, the authority will no longer obliged to comply with the request.
- 3. If SPC is transferring the request because it does not hold the information itself but believes it to be held by another public authority, SPC must inform the requester that the information is not held within the 20 working day limit.
- 4. Section 10(3) enables an authority to extend the 20 working day limit up to a 'reasonable' time in any case where it requires more time to determine whether or not the balance of the public interest lies in maintaining an exemption; or it needs further time to consider whether it would be in the public interest to confirm or deny whether the information is held.
  - This extension will only apply to requests where the authority considers a 'qualified exemption' (an exemption that is subject to a public interest test) to be engaged. The

Act does not define what might constitute a 'reasonable' extension of time. The view is that an authority should take no more than an additional 20 working days to consider the public interest, meaning that the total time spent dealing with the request should not exceed 40 working days.

#### **Refusing a FOI Request**

SPC can refuse an entire request under the following circumstances:

- It would cost too much or take too much staff time to deal with the request.
- The request is vexatious.
- The request repeats a previous request from the same person.
- Time Related Refusal(s) the cost limit for complying with a request or a linked series of requests from the same person or group is set at £450 for a Parish Council. There is a cost ceiling when calculating the costs of complying, the aggregate (total) costs of all related requests received within 60 days from the same person or from people who seem to be working together, can be refused.
- 2. Vexatious Related Refusal(s) If evaluated as vexatious SPC does not have to comply with any part of the request, or even confirm or deny whether the information is held. When assessing whether a request is vexatious, the Act permits SPC to take into account the context and history of a request, including the identity of the requester and SPC's previous contact with them. (The requester may appeal to the Information Commissioner's Office.)

SPC's decision will be based on whether the request is likely to cause a disproportionate or unjustifiable level of distress, disruption or irritation.

Detailed Guidelines will be referenced as and when necessary, as issued by the Information Commissioner's Office *"Dealing with vexatious requests (section 14) Freedom of Information Act"* 

# Appendix 1

# Information available from Stalisfield Parish Council under the FOI Act

Information to be published	How the information can be obtained	Cost (Excludes second class postage)
Class1 - Who we are and what we do Current structure only		
Who's who on the Council and its Committees	Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet
Contact details for Parish Clerk and Council members (named contacts where possible with telephone number and email address (if used))	Website/Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet
Class 2 – What we spend and how we spend it Current and previous financia	al year	
Annual return form and report by auditor	Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet
Finalised budget	Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet
Asset Register	Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet
Precept	Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet
Financial Standing Orders and Regulations	Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet
Grants given and received	Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet
List of current contracts awarded and value of contract	Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet
Members' allowances and expenses	Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet
Cheques raised over £500	Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet
Class 3 – What our priorities are and how we are doing		
Parish Plan (current and previous)	Hard copy from Parish Clerk (until out of print)	£6.00

.,	Free/ 20p per sheet	
ninimum		
Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Consultation web pages /Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Mid Kent Planning Portal /Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
nd procedures	I	
Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
t	Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk   Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk   Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk   Hard copy from Parish Clerk   Consultation web pages /Hard copy from Parish Clerk   Mid Kent Planning Portal /Hard copy from Parish Clerk   Mid Kent Planning Portal /Hard copy from Parish Clerk   Website/ Hard copy from Parish Clerk	

Any publicly available register or list (if any are held this should be publicised; in most circumstances existing access provisions will suffice)	Email /Hard copy from Parish Clerk Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Register of members' interests	Email /Hard copy from Parish Clerk Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Register of gifts and hospitality	Email /Hard copy from Parish Clerk Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Class 7 – The services we offer Current information only			
Burial grounds and closed churchyards	Access by prior appointment		
Parks, playing fields and recreational facilities	Email /Hard copy from Parish Clerk Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	
Seating, litter bins, memorials and lighting	Email /Hard copy from Parish Clerk Parish Clerk	Free/ 20p per sheet	

TYPE OF CHARGE	DESCRIPTION	BASIS OF CHARGE
Disbursement cost	Photocopying @20p per sheet (black & white)	Actual cost to SPC
	SPC will not provide colour prints or photocopying	

# Appendix 2

# How does the Freedom of Information Act affect data protection?

The Data Protection Act 1998 gives rules for handling information about people. It includes the right for people to access their personal data. The Freedom of Information Act and the Data Protection Act come under the heading of information rights and are regulated by the Information Commissioner's Office.

When a person makes a request for their own information, this is a subject access request under the Data Protection Act. However, members of the public often wrongly think it is the Freedom of Information Act that gives them the right to their personal information.

The Data Protection Act exists to protect people's right to privacy, whereas the Freedom of Information Act is about getting rid of unnecessary secrecy. These two aims are not necessarily incompatible but there can be a tension between them and applying them sometimes requires careful judgement.

When someone makes a request for information that includes someone else's personal data, SPC will need to carefully balance the case for transparency and openness under the Freedom of Information Act against the data subject's right to privacy under the Data Protection Act in deciding whether we can release the information without breaching the data protection principles.

Date Approved: 22 January 2018

Signed by the Chairman: